
 
 

Results Measurement Working Group 
Agenda, 19th June 2023 

 

3rd May 2023 
 

 
Venue: Venue details are available in agendas circulated to DCED members via email.  
 

Date and time:  19th June 2023, 13:00 – 17:00 CET  
 

 
 

Time (CET) Topic 

12:30 – 13:00 Optional lunch and networking on arrival  

13:00 – 14:00 

An introduction to the DCED Standard for Results Measurement  
 

- This session will introduce the DCED Standard for results measurement which 
provides a framework for guiding credible monitoring and reporting of results. 
Around 150 projects in 50 countries are currently using the Standard in different 
themes in private sector development, ranging from value chain development, to 
challenge funds, to business environment reform. It remains one of the products for 
which the DCED is best known in the PSD community. 

14:00 – 15:00 

Measuring systems change 
 

- This will be an interactive discussion led by Netherlands Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
(MOFA) and the Netherlands Enterprise Agency (RVO) on how to measure systems 
change at an agency level. MOFA and RVO will introduce the PADEO (Programmatic 
Approach Sustainable Economic Development) approach through which the Dutch 
government is applying a systems change approach to contribute to long term, 
sustainable impact. They will explain how they are aiming to capture systems change 
as a result of the PADEO approach and challenges faced in aggregating results. The 
example is provided to trigger a broader discussion on how to assess, report and 
communicate about systems change and share learnings and good practice within the 
community. 

15:00 – 15:30 Coffee break  

15:30 – 16:30 

Measuring job quality 
 

- Over the last six months, the International Labour Organization (ILO) Systems Change 
Initiative carried out a series of talks with eight DCED member agencies to unpack 
questions on how to define and  subsequently measure job quality. ILO will present 
the findings of these sessions and share a new tool to measure the effect of digital 
labour platforms on job quality. The objective of the session will be to initiate further 
dialogue on how to improve the measurement of job quality and identify learning 
products or sessions that can help donors and agencies in this. 

16:30 – 17:00 2023 – 2024 Work Plan discussion, AOB and meeting closure 

 


